
 

 

  

 

Trustee Frank Reyes Chancellor Bruce Baron President Kevin Horan President Diana Rodriguez 

Mariana Lopez Sylvia Juarez Rebeccah Warren-Marlatt Kristina Hannon 

Angel Rodriguez    

Agenda Items Discussion Action Items/Tasks 

I. Call to Order & 
Introductions 

Chancellor Bruce Baron called the meeting to order 
at 1:09 p.m. 

 

II. Approval of 
Minutes 

Approval of minutes from 01/14/2019.  

Action Item –  
Minutes Approval - tabled 

 

III. Current Topics 

Comparison of Benefits & Rights Based on 
Immigration Status – Sylvia Juarez. 
 
S. Juarez reported the comparison of benefits & 
rights based on immigration status, the 2017-18 
apportionment attendance report, and the Dream 
Data Report D. Rodriguez asked for details 
regarding the Dream Data Report and S. Juarez 
reported that this report is for CALGrants and the 
numbers aren’t as high due to it is a possibility of 
students saving for CALGrants when they transfer.  
 
M. Lopez reported she is marketing and informing 
her clients/students at the Mexican Consulate.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt believed we should get a lot of 
support for k-12 feeder schools, especially with the 
College Promise.  
 
CCC Dreamers Project Report – Sylvia Juarez. 
S. Juarez reported the CCC Dreamers Project 
show undocumented students most pressing 
needs. S. Juarez reported she is attending regional 
meetings that discuss the findings in the report. 
Trustee Reyes urged S. Juarez to use our local 
officials to get a regional meeting in the Inland 
Empire. 
 
S. Juarez reported each campus will assess this 
differently based on resources.  
 
Undocumented Student Advocacy Task Force 
Update – Sylvia Juarez.  

 

Hispanic Speaking Institutions (HSI) Committee Meeting  
MINUTES 
114 S. Del Rosa Drive (SBCCD Boardroom) 

San Bernardino, CA 92408 April 8, 2019 

 



 
May 2nd, showcasing movies with a student panel.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt mentioned this is excellent and 
exciting for undocumented students.   
 
SB13 to be brought to the table for undocumented 
students affairs support on the campuses.  
 
2019 Building Diversity Summit – Kristina Hannon.  
 
State Chancellor’s Office and Academic Senate 
(statewide) hosted the IEPI-CCCCO Diversity 
Summit. The goal was to identify student success.  
 
Student equity gaps – the number of students of 
color has grown while the number of faculty of 
color hired remained the same.  
 
K Hannon reported the demographics for SBCCD, 
CHC, and SBVC. K. Hannon reported our numbers 
are a bit better that state average. 
 
SBCCD Next Steps –  
Multiple Methods form will be finalized and 
approved on May 4th and sent to State Chancellor.  
 
Professional Development and trainings on 
diversity have been successful and they continue 
to grow to retain faculty/staff.  
 
Onboarding process is expected fall 2019.  
 
Screening committee handbook for speakers.  
 
Adjunct pools/internship with local k-12 
administrators and certificated staff.  
 
Actively taking the District from compliance to 
competent.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt commented there are many 
boundaries the adjunct instructors have to cross to 
get into k-12.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt recommended have a district 
conversation regarding equity.  
 
K. Hannon reported every college is having the 
same issues. Seems everyone was hungry for the 



information. A. Rodriguez has offered to help with 
marketing.  
 
K. Hannon commented they are missing the mark 
in where they are recruiting. Any opportunities that 
will allow SBCCD to give information of hiring, R. 
Warren-Marlatt reported Trustee Houston might be 
a good connection.  
 
M. Lopez reported she went to a conference last 
month in Long Beach, and many attendees were 
speaking about SBCCD’s College Promise.  
 
R . Warren-Marlatt reported on the SBCCD’s 
“Dreamers” conference. The purpose is to give 
learning opportunities. The HSI committee has 
agreed to support.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt will reach out to C. Rodriguez 
and include A. Rodriguez and K. Hannon to start 
this planning process.  
 
Trustee Reyes reported he just returned from 
Washington, D.C. HACU is pushing now for k-12 
and higher education.  Trustee Reyes commented 
if RCC and SBCCD collaborate we are more likely 
to receive funding.   
 
 
 
MAY AGENDA 
B. Baron - Fall Chicago Conference HACU and 
recommended students. 
 
M. Lopez to give 1-page report.  
 
R. Warren-Marlatt - District wide equity strategic 
planning  
 

VI. Next Meeting 
Next Meeting:  
May 13, 2019, 1:00 p.m. SBCCD Boardroom 

 

VI. Adjournment Meeting adjourned 2:10 p.m.  
 

 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
Heather Ford 
Executive Administrative Assistant 
Office of the Chancellor 
San Bernardino Community College District 


